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EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

Gula Melaka Haji Shaari is a sole proprietor business founded by Haji Shaari Bin Adam

aged 72 years old. He started his own business in 1995 when he was 16 years old. Gula

Melaka Haji Shaari is a home-based business and it is originally from Kampung Serkam,

Merlimau Melaka.

Gula Melaka Haji Shaari is a business that produces Gula Melaka. Haji Shaari got the idea

to sell Gula Melaka when there were a few leased coconut trees and that is when he started

making Gula Melaka. The business name is originally from his own name which is ‘ Shaari Bin

Adam’. This is because he wants to differentiate with other Gula Melaka sellers that already

exist in the market. His aim at first was to sell to the kuih's seller but now he also focused on

selling Gula Melaka to the restaurant owner.

Not as before when he only promoted his products by sending it through the small shops,

now Gula Melaka Haji Shaari using social media platforms such as Whatsapp to promote his

product more widely than before. His product is unique compared to the others' same product

because he is the only distributor and manufacturer that produces the ‘Original’ Gula Melaka in

Melaka.

Gula Melaka Asli Haji Shaari have strengths that made the business become successful.

This is because Gula Melaka is already known by people whether in Melaka or outside of

Melaka. So it is easy to promote and they already know the use of Gula Melaka itself. Other

than that, Gula Melaka Asli Haji Shaari produces the only Original Gula Melaka that is from

Coconut tree and no preservative added in the products. Gula Melaka Asli Haji Shaari also

already has loyal customers that always order and buy Gula Melaka Asli from him.
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But in business, it also has weaknesses that we should take action on, the same as Haji

Shaari’s business. In his business, the Gula Melaka Asli that he produces is easily melted

because there are no preservatives added in the product. Other than that, the product also

cannot stand the heat. Gula Melaka Asli Haji Shaari has less customers through online

mediums. These three weaknesses should he take action and focus more on how to fix it to

make the business become more successful. Gula Melaka Haji Shaari’s price strategies are

based on the product's sizes, cost, customers and competitors. Haji Shaari takes care of his

customers by always checking on product quality and being honest in the business.
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1.0 INTRODUCTION

1.1 BACKGROUND OF STUDY

The subject of Principles of Entrepreneurships are taken by students to explore many

information in the entrepreneurships world. This subject can help students to become more

innovative and inventive in developing a better entrepreneurship system in our daily life and also

produce a creative entrepreneur in the future. This course has been introduced in many

colleges and universities in order to increase the knowledge of entrepreneurship.

In this case study, students were assigned to do some interviews with any local small

business entrepreneur. Students have to study the business that was done by the entrepreneur

and do some analysis of how the entrepreneur produces the products until they generate the

income. Students are required to generate some ideas on how the entrepreneur can increase

their business performances. In this assignment, students are exposed to how the

entrepreneurs run their business and how it engages with marketing and finance

activity.

Our group chose to do some studies of a business of Gula Melaka that was known as

Gula Melaka Asli Hj Shaari. This business was related to the food industry. Our group is able to

identify the problems that the business faced and find solutions to increase the business

performances in the future. This assignment enables students to understand more about the

entrepreneurship world and develops more creative thinkers.
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1.2 PURPOSE OF STUDY

There are a few courses that are related to entrepreneurship which students need to

take. The course Principles of Entrepreneurship (ENT530) is an elective subject for students

from Bachelor of Accounting. This course produces an individual with a splendid attitude and

outstandings characters.

Students enrolled in ENT530 must do a case study on a small or medium-sized

firm.This case study will assist students in increasing their abilities in problem-solving by

examining and applying their knowledge. The case study is about helping students to make

decisions and become more aware of their surroundings. They would find some difficulties of

the owner’s problems while performing the case study of the company and making

recommendations for solutions.

Students must also create a business plan based on the business canvas model for the

small firm they have chosen. Students will eventually be able to develop higher-order thinking

abilities and become creative people. Students must think creatively and stay alert during the

procedure.
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2.0 COMPANY INFORMATION

2.1 COMPANY BACKGROUND

Company’s name Gula Melaka Hj Shaari

Address Lorong, Jalan Hj Hassan, Kampung Serkam, 77300 Merlimau,
Melaka

Industry Food Industry

Owner Shaari Bin Adam

Contact number 012-688 2514

Year established 1995

Table 1.0

The name of the business chosen is Gula Melaka Asli Hj Shaari. This is a small business

that sells original Gula Melaka. The owner of the business is Shaari Bin Adam aged 72 years

old. He started his business since year 1995 when he was only 16 years old. He got the idea to

sell Gula Melaka when there were a few leased coconut tree land and that is when he start

making Gula Melaka.He chose to name his business by his own name Hj Shaari to differentiate

with other Gula Melaka sellers. He started his business by plucking the coconut on his own and

buying some equipment to make the Nira Kelapa. The business is located at Kampung Serkam,

Merlimau Melaka which was at his own house.

The company’s primary product is Gula Melaka as stated. The Gula Melaka come in

different shape and packaging in order to fulfill customer’s need.At first, he only aim to sell the

Gula Melaka to Kuih’s seller but with his passion in the business he able to expand his

business. He also provides delivering the Gula Melaka to his customers by himself. Besides, his

clients come from all around Malaysia, as well as neighbouring states such as Kuala Lumpur ,

Johor and Selangor. He has the experience in managing business when his father run a small

grocery store in his hometown and this help him to explore more about running a business.
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2.2 ORGANIZATIONAL STRUCTURE

An organizational structure is a framework that describes how certain activities are directed in

order to achieve an organization's objectives. These activities include things like rules, roles,

and responsibilities.

The organizational structure also influences the flow of information between levels within the

company.

Figure 2.0

Encik Shaari Adam is the owner and the founder of Gula Melaka Asli Hj Shaari.He has three

workers and all the staffs are residents of the neighborhood.
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2.3 PRODUCTS & SERVICES

A product is a tangible object that is placed on the market for the aim of acquisition, attention, or

consumption, whereas a service is an intangible item that is the outcome of one or more

people's efforts. Although it may appear that the primary distinction between the two concepts is

their tangibility, this is not always the case. The majority of services are intangible, whereas the

products are not.

The main business of Encik Shaari Bin Adam is Gula Melaka Asli. The Gula Melaka

comes in two different packages which are Gula Melaka in big size and another one is in mini

size. Moreover, Encik Shaari offers a delivery service to those cutomers that ordered the Gula

Melaka. Encik Shaari delivers the goods depends on when the customers want it since he

wants to make a good impressions to the customers and also streghten the relationships with

the customers.

Illustrations Product Name Description

Illustration 1 Gula Melaka Asli A package of four big Gula Melaka in bamboo shape.

This usually purchased by those who wants to add

Gula Melaka in food.This product cost for RM12

Illustration 2 Gula Melaka Mini A package of 9 small Gula Melaka in round shape.

This type of package usually purchased to make door

gifts.This product cost for RM 10

Table 2.0
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2.4  BUSINESS, MARKETING AND OPERATING STRATEGIES

2.4.1 Business Strategy

A business strategy is a plan for a company’s activities and choices in order to achieve

its objectives. Encik Shaari focus on promoting his products to kuih merchant, housewives,

restaurateur and local people.These type of customers usually add Gula Melaka in their dishes

to make it tastier. Thus, Encik Shaari always keeps his products fresh to maintain its quality.

2.4.2 Marketing Strategies

A marketing strategy is a company's overall game plan for reaching out to potential leads

and converting them into clients of the company's products or services.Encik Shaari  sells

original Gula Melaka without any preservatives and sugar added which is the unique part of his

products.The taste will be different if any sugar or preservatives were added. He started his

business by sending the Gula Melaka to small grocery stores and his friends and family help

promote his business. Right now, Encik Shaari starts using social media platform to promote his

business.Besides, any customer that purchase the gula melaka in bulk will get a cheaper

price.This help to gain more of the customer’s attention to purchase with him.

2.4.3 Operational Strategy

The company's aims and aspirations, as well as the actual strategies for achieving those goals,

are the subject of operational strategy. Encik Shaari always make sure that his product is fresh

and in a good shape to maintain its quality. Hence, customers believe that Encik Shaari will only

sell a high quality Gula Melaka to them. There are many restraurateurs and kuih merchant that

become his regular customers.The reputation of a company benefits from quality assurance.

Customer confidence is boosted by a good reputation, which leads to loyalty, thus even a tenth

of a percent rise is beneficial. Moreover, The business offers to deliver the ordered goods

directly to the customers. This action can protects the goods from any damage since it can be

monitored anytime.
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2.5  Financial Achievement

Every small business's most basic goal is to be profitable. Profitability is defined as generating

more revenue than operating expenditures. Sales revenue, interest on investments, and rent on

business property owned by the owner are all examples of business revenue. Labour

cost,vehicle expenditure, advertising, utilities, interest payments, licences, and taxes are

examples of operating expenses.

Encik Shaari’s business usually can obtain a targeted profit after two weeks selling

it.Encik Shaari able to buy a lorry and a car just for delivering the goods to the customers.Other

than that, Encik Shaari’s monthly profit could achieve RM10 000.
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3.0 Company Analysis

Business Model Canvas

Table 3.0
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3.1 Key partner

Partnerships are becoming a cornerstone of many business strategies, and companies form
them for a variety of reasons. Alliances are formed by businesses to improve their business
models, decrease risk, or acquire resources. Strategic alliances between non-competitors,
coopetition strategic partnerships between competitors, joint ventures to establish new
enterprises, and buyer-supplier agreements to ensure reliable supplies are the four types of
partnerships that can be distinguished.

Packaging supplier

Wrapping gula melaka with the right material is crucial. The packaging should protect the
product from contamination, water, and pests entering the package. Tuan Shaari must choose
appropriate material to wrap the merchandise in order to keep it in excellent condition. Gula
Melaka Asli Hj Shaari will receive thick plastic wrapping from the provider on a monthly basis.
Their quality must be maintained at all times, and packaging is an important factor in doing so.

3.2 Key activities

A number of Key Activities are required by the business model. These are the most critical acts
a business must take in order to succeed. They, like Key Resources, must develop and present
a Value Proposition, reach out to new markets, manage customer relationships, and generate
money.

Production

Production is the first key activity of Gula Melaka Asli Hj Shaari. This activity consists of the
production of the product from the first step which is choosing material to the last process which
is packaging. Everything is supervised to ensure the best quality is made to distribute to
consumers so they are satisfied.

Marketing

Marketing is most important in order to reach the targeted customer, marketing is to introduce
the product to new customers and make it known. If the targeted customer doesn’t know about
the product how to proceed to the next step. After people start to know the product then that
means the marketing is successful. After successful marketing then we can proceed to the next
key activities.

Selling

Selling is where the product will be distributed, some of the product will be sold at the shop and
some will be distributed to restaurants and other places using the lorry and the van that Gula
Melaka Asli Hj Shaari owned.
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3.3 Key resources

Every company model necessitates the use of Key Resources. Your resources enable your
company to develop and advertise a Value Proposition, reach out to new markets, maintain
connections with existing customers, and generate income. Depending on the type of business
model, different Key Resources are required. Physical, financial, intellectual, and human
resources are all valuable resources.

Physical resources

Physical resources are tangible assets that the company uses to produce revenue. Physical
resources for Gula Melaka Asli Hj Shaari include pots, stoves, and cooking tools utilised in gula
melaka manufacture. These pieces of equipment are critical to the success of the company
because they are the foundation of its operations.

Human resources

Human resources are needed in this type of business for production using machineries since
the machineries are semi-automatic. Also, the company needs workers to pluck the coconut
since to make gula melaka must use nira kelapa. So, human resources are very important so
that the business can run smoothly.

3.4 Value proposition

Customers choose your business above others because of your Value Proposition. It addresses
your customer's problem or meets their requirements. Each Value Proposition is made up of a
carefully selected set of products and/or services that are tailored to the needs of a certain
Customer Segment. Some Value Propositions are innovative, representing a novel or disruptive
offering. Others may be similar to current market offers but with additional features and benefits.

Original gula melaka without gula pasir

Many gula melaka in the market use gula pasir to reduce their production cost, but Gula Melaka
Asli Hj Shaari uses purely nira kelapa without the addition of dye or sweetener. This is what
makes Gula Melaka Asli Hj Shaari liked by their customers since the taste is good and the
material used to make this gula melaka is not from gula pasir like other gula melaka in the
market.
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3.5 Customer relationship

Your business should decide what kind of relationship it wants to have with each customer
segment. Relationships are formed as a result of your many Channels. Relationships can be
human or automated, transactional or long-term, and they can be used to acquire, maintain, or
increase sales. The kind of customer relationships you establish have a significant impact on
the whole customer experience.

Personal

Human communication is involved in the personal sort of client contact. Customers can
purchase it straight from the shop, or they can use shopee or Facebook to place an order. The
organisation believes that direct engagement with customers would provide them with a better
understanding of their challenges, resulting in increased customer loyalty and happiness.

3.6 Channels

Your sales, distribution, and communication Customers interact with your business through
channels. Your Channels are crucial consumer touchpoints that contribute to the overall
customer experience. Distribution channels are used by businesses to out-reach customers.

Mouth-To-Mouth

The most effective way of distribution is mouth-to-mouth. Because this business is located in a
village area, mouth-to-mouth marketing is simple. It is simpler to entice clients to come in, select
the product, and purchase. Because it is difficult for this market group to adjust to social media
sites such as Instagram or Twitter, they rarely use them. Village people are more easily reached
by this type of distribution route than city dwellers since their connections are stronger.

Shopee

Other ways to purchase the product is using Shopee, this is also convenient to people that are
not Melaka but want to buy original gula melaka. Shopee is a platform for them to sell the
product to people in other states and make it known all over Malaysia. By using Shopee they
can increase their revenue since not many other places sell original gula melaka in other states.

Facebook

Facebook is a place for the older generation to socialize. Teenagers may not be interested in
gula melaka but older people like gula melaka because they can cook kuih and food using it. On
Facebook, there is a marketplace where they can sell their product there and promote their
shop at the same time in Facebook groups. Since Facebook still has a lot of users, using this
method is good for the business.

17



3.7 Customer segment

Customers are the lifeblood of your business. Your business will not last long without (profitable)
consumers. To better serve your consumers, divide them into segments based on common
needs, tasks to be completed, common behaviors, or other characteristics. One or more large or
tiny Customer Segments may exist in your business strategy. You must decide which segments
to serve and which segments to skip. Once you've taken this decision, you may carefully
develop your business model around a thorough understanding of specific customer wants and
tasks to be completed. If their needs necessitate and justify a discrete Value Proposition,
customer groups constitute separate segments.

Restaurateur

Gula Melaka Asli Hj Shaari wants to sell gula melaka to local restaurant owners so they can
utilise it in their recipes. Some restaurants will stock up on gula melaka on a weekly basis. Gula
Melaka Asli Hj Shaari will provide gula melaka in response to the restaurant's request. Gula
Melaka Asli Hj Shaari can also place the product near the restaurant counter to advertise it and
earn the restaurant a commission. At the same time, it will provide them with an opportunity to
sell their goods.

Local People

Locals who buy gula melaka at their shops may be assured they are getting a fresh product
because they can acquire it right after it is made. Locals can save money by buying it straight
from their shop instead of from merchants. To put it another way, if locals choose to buy it
directly, they will save money because it is cheaper. This is the main reason why Melaka people
prefer to get it directly from the store since it is cheaper.

Kuih Merchant

Some of the kuih merchant at Melaka will buy from the Gula Melaka Asli Hj Shaari since some
of the kuih need to use gula melaka like onde-onde, even they buy it at low volume but they buy
it consistently since they need gula melaka to make kuih. It can be said that the kuih merchants
always repeat their order from the Gula Melaka Asli Hj Shaari.

Housewives

There are many housewives from the neighborhood area and it gives benefit to Gula Melaka
Asli Hj Shaari since they will buy gula melaka to cook at their home. Since the gula melaka is
without granulated sugar it is famous for their taste among housewives in the neighborhood.
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3.8 Cost structure

Cost structure is the expenditure incurred by a company.

Packaging cost

To ensure the quality, Gula Melaka Asli Hj Shaari uses the best plastic which is thick and strong.
So they need to pay and have to deal with their packaging partner to package their product so
the product is packaged.

Labor cost

Labour cost is the cost of the wages that the business must pay to their employees. Gula
Melaka Asli Hj Shaari have 3 workers. They also need to pay for workers that pluck coconut.

3.9 Revenue streams

A revenue stream is a source of profit for a business. To put it another way, revenue streams are
the various ways in which a business earns money by selling things or providing services. The
sorts of revenue that a company records in its books are determined by the activities that it
engages in.

Sales of gula Melaka

This company generates its income solely by gula melaka sales activity. It includes the delivery
services and recurring revenue. This income is used to pay all the costs and also give profit to
the owner. The revenue is continuous until the business stops.
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4.0 Findings and Discussion

4.1 Major Problems and Solution

Every business has their own strengths and weaknesses in every section. Based on our
findings and discussions, Gula Melaka Asli Hj Shaari is a small business run by an experienced
person since a long time ago. Developing a business has the right method that needs to be
followed and practiced to make it more famous and successful. In order to increase their sales
of gula Melaka, they have several problems that need to be solved which are:

1. Easily Melted

Based on our interview session with the owner of Gula Melaka Asli Hj Shaari, we found that the
business has a problem with the gula Melaka. The gula Melaka cannot stand the heat and it
makes the gula Melaka easily melted. This can make customers not buy the gula Melaka
because of the quality. They don’t have a suitable place to keep or maintain the gula Melaka
which means not easily melted. Not only that, they don’t have a suitable packaging that can
make gula Melaka not melted. As we know, it is important to keep gula Melaka from melting. It’s
like the quality of the gula Melaka. If gula Melaka doesn't have quality, customers will not buy
the gula Melaka.

● Solution 1

In our opinion, they should use a new packaging that can stand the heat. It’s important to
prevent gula Melaka from melting. Customers will value the quality of the gula Melaka. If the
gula Melaka has good quality which means it is not easily melted, surely many customers will
buy it. In addition, the owner can sell their product online without worrying if gula Melaka will
melt because the packaging is safe for shipping by courier. Usually, the shipping process will
take time before it is delivered to the customer. So, the new packaging might help the owner to
make sure the product ordered has been reached safely.

● Solution 2

Other than that, they can be placed in the gula Melaka in suitable places like a freezer.
The suitable place for gula Melaka has played a major role in maintaining the quality of the gula
Melaka. As a result, Gula Melaka Asli Hj Shaari may be able to boost their business
performance and streamline their operations. In order to maintain the quality of gula Melaka,
they need to keep the product in a suitable place before it's sold.
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2. Less customers through online medium

Based on our perspective of this business marketing, we found that the business promotes their
product by manufacturing to grocery stores nearby in Melaka. Other than that, they used several
social media such as facebook, whatsapp and shopee as platforms for promoting their product.
However, depending on these three social media without making a post or interesting promotion
will not be effective. In addition, if we use facebook to advertise our business, an advertisement
must be made several times. The advertisement must consist of a few things to attract
customers. It will take a longer time for our product to be noticed by more people if we do it
alone. To promote a business, we should have to use all available opportunities provided
nowadays in social media especially.

● Solution 1

In our opinion, one of the best ways to expand their business for getting noticed by
customers through social media is by being open for recruitment of resellers throughout
Malaysia. Nowadays, there are many resellers selling products as an additional income. The
resellers consist of students, unemployees and other people with a different status or work
whether man or woman. For example, businesses such as MAMASAB, a famous company that
sells cookies and cake around the world. So, the reseller must choose a package that is offered
with a lower price. As an example, if the normal price is RM12, the reseller just needs to pay
RM9 for each gula melaka and they must take above 18 packets. This will expand Gula Melaka
Asli Hj Shaari throughout Malaysia because the reseller is not only from Melaka. In addition, the
demand for this product might increase when the amount of resellers also increases. It will give
benefits to both parties as their income and revenue.

● Solution 2

Other than recruiting resellers, promoting business through social media needs a right
method to attract people. In facebook especially, the time and caption in posting feed is the most
important thing because it might attract our customers for being interested in trying our product.
The copywriting must consist of softsell and hardsell. People nowadays refer more to social
media as their shopping platform if the product that they want to buy is far from them. For
example, the owner should promote his business at 9.00 p.m. as other people are already back
to their home for resting after working tired. At this time, usually people are scrolling their social
media and big opportunities notice the advertisements made by us. The owner also can use
Tiktok as the promotion platform as that application is already used by 500 millions users
around the world. Making content which interests people can be viral and at the same time
make their product known by others. In addition, the owner can create a new department
specifically for designing and promoting gula Melaka through social media.
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3. Lack number of workers

A sole proprietorship business has its own set of benefits and drawbacks. It is a common choice
of business structure among small business owners since it is simple to set up and
disassemble. The benefits of being a sole proprietor include keeping all profits and having
complete control over the business. In the meanwhile, the downsides of single proprietorship
include a lack of consistency and the possibility of making poor decisions. Based on our
information that we get from the interview, the owner only has three workers to manage the
business. Not only that, they use a manual method which is to make gula Melaka using a pot.
That means they cannot process large numbers or orders at one time. Because they employ a
manual process and lack of workers, the lead time for orders will be longer if numerous
customers place an order at the same time. Customers will think twice about ordering again if
this happens because they will have to wait a certain amount of time for the order to be finished.
As a result, due to a small number of devoted customers, the owner will have a difficult time
continuing to run her firm for a longer amount of time. Customers that are loyal are particularly
crucial in the small business sector because they will help the company reach out to others,
such as their family, friends, and coworkers, provided the services or products satisfy their
expectations.

● Solution 1

In our opinion, one of the best ways to avoid losing customers is to hire more workers. It
is because the process of making gula melaka takes a longer time to be done. When the
product is already known or getting more orders than usual, the demand of the product also
increases. In this situation, the production process of gula Melaka can be done without
interruption due to the lack of workers. This business will be able to receive many orders as
many workers can be involved in the process of making gula Melaka. Other than that, the owner
should hire a worker to design a poster and manage social media because they are more
knowledgeable and know more about it.

● Solution 2

Since they use a manual method to make gula Melaka using a pot, we think they should
buy a machine to make gula Melaka in order to speed up the process of making gula Melaka.
As we know, gula Melaka Hj Shaari is original, so maintaining the taste of this product is the
priority in using machines. By using a machine, the workers can make another process without
waiting as when they are using a manual process. The time of preparing gula Melaka also can
be saved when the machine is used. Lastly, the quality of gula Melaka is guaranteed as the
machine is already set in an exact way.
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4.2 Advantages and Disadvantages of the solutions

Below are the summary of our solutions and its advantages and disadvantages:

SOLUTIONS ADVANTAGES DISADVANTAGES

New packaging stand the
heat

Can make gula Melaka stand
the heat.

The owner needs to pay the
cost of the packaging.

Suitable place like freezer Can make gula Melaka not
easily melted and maintain
the quality.

It will cost the owner not only
the cost to buy a freezer but
the cost of electricity too.
Other than that, it needs a
bigger space to place the
freezer.

Recruitment of resellers Can expand their business
from one person to another
person. So, the product will
be known by more people.

The profit for each packet will
be lower because resellers
get a discount for buying in
higher quantities.

Use a right method through
social media

The business can reach their
targeted customers using the
unique features of each
social media.

The owner must always
update or advertise on social
media.

Hire more workers The owner can rely on the
worker whenever he has
something urgent to do.

Even if the firm is not doing
well, the owner must pay the
employee's salary on time.

Buy machine in production Can finish the orders on time
with a better quality as the
machine is already being set
exactly.

The owner must pay the cost
of the machine and have to
pay the cost of repairs if
damaged.

Table 4.0
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5.0  Conclusion

Gula Melaka Asli Haji Shaari has grown so much from 1997 when it was initially started

operating and until now. It also has so many customers that already love the products and the

originality and the quality of the products. In those years many obstacles and problems that Haji

Shaari went through. Through this case study that we conducted, we learnt that becoming an

entrepreneur is not easy. Becoming an entrepreneur and establishing a business requires

thinking and taking many risks and obstacles to become successful. An entrepreneur also

cannot make unwise decisions in business. If you make wrong moves, everything will become

not okay and you have to check again the problems. Other than that, strengths and weaknesses

also need to be focused on. As Anthony Robbins said, “every problem is a gift and without

problems we would not grow”. From this we know, without obstacles the business will not grow

properly and become successful. There are many steps that we can use to grow the business in

the future.
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7.0  Appendices
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Lorry for delivery

Figure 4.1

Car for delivery

Figure 4.2
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Interview Question

Figure 5.0
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Extra Written
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Figure 6.0
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