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I ntrocf uction 

Jlra6ica ).;eans <tafe is a business tfiat serves 
esyecia{{y Sungai Petani 'Town yeoy{e '.Jt.rabica 
'Beans', a different and finest coffee beans from 
arrouncf tfie wor{cf sucfi as Co{umbia, 'Brazi{, Costa 
Rica and :New Guinea. 

'Tfie Jlra6ica ).;eans is exyectecf to oyerate in 
January 2003. It conceyt is to create a range of 
distinctive, indivicfua{{y sty{ed coffees by combining 
traditiona{ craft ski{{s witfi modern teclino{ogy and 
equipment. 'Tfie enteryrise wi{{ quick{y estabCislied a 
growing demand from customer wfio were no Conger 
content witfi yre-yack commercia{ b{ends, but were in 
searcfi of fresfier, more f{ovorfu{ a{ternatives. 'Tfie 
success ofJlra6icaneans wi{{ grew witfi its reyutation of 
yrovufing an outstanding range of fine coffees 
yresented in styCisfi and fiigfi quaCity yack.aging. 

Otherwise, there is no sucfi cafe in Sungai Petani 
'Town tfiat serves tfie yeoy{e Cike ours cafe. We giving 
tfiem a fiigfi standart service and {ifesty{e 
environment. So, tfie cornyetetion a{most does not 
exist. Its make our business easi{y to grow uy and 
standing in tfie same {eve{ witfi otfier business tfiat 
invo{ved in tlie same business fie{d Cike San 
:Francissco, Coffee 'Beans, Starbuck and etc. 



In {ong-term, yotentia{ to estafJ{isfi sucli business 
in Sungai Petani Town is very liigli. 'Because, s - 10

years from now on, Sungai Petani _Town wi{{ he
surrounded fJy a {ot of Proffessiona{ or e{ite yeoy{e
sucli as Proffessors, {ecturers, doctors, managers,
{awyers, engineers, executives, hankers, teacliers and
etc.
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