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ABSTRACT 

This study uses the alignment effect hypothesis from agency theory and the 
lentrenchment hypothesis to examine the firms’ financial reporting conservatism relative 
to the effectiveness of their audit committees and the dominance of directors. The study is 
also extended to determine the association of audit committee effectiveness and directors’ 
dominance and their linkage to the firms’ degree of accounting conservatism The proxy 
for audit committee effectiveness in this study are audit committee independence, 
accounting financial expertise and diligence. Meanwhile, the proxies for directors’ 
dominance are executive director’s dominance, family director’s dominance and audit 
committee shareholding. Using Khan and Watts’s (2009) C_SCORE measures of 
accounting conservatism, [he C_SCORE of 795 firms-year observation from Bursa 
Malaysia main board is calculated. The findings reveal that only professional accounting 
expertise and audit committee diligence are significant to explain the variations in the 
firms’ financial reporting conservatism. The results also suggest that executive ownership 
and CEO duality are detrimental to firms’ degree of accounting conservatism. Finally, it 
was found that the presence of professional financial accounting experts in the audit 
committees and audit committee diligence are able to strengthen the reporting 
conservatism in firms with high executive ownerships. The findings also suggest that an 
increase of professional accounting expertise in the audit committees and audit committee 
diligence are also able to moderate the negative association between Chief Executive 
Officer (CEO) duality and accounting conservatism. The findings from this thesis 
suggest the importance of having directons with professional accounting certification in 
the audit committees in order to provide efficient monitoring. The study also reveals that 
highly diligent audit committees play a huge part in encouraging conservative 
accouming. The findings also reveal some disturbing evidence. Contradictory to the 
general corporate governance principles, the association of audit committee independence 
is negative and insignificant. The implications from this findings, suggest that regulatory 
bodies should consider increasing the appoimment of directors with professional 
accounting certifications in the audit committees. Besides that, it is also suggested that 
the committees should meet more frequently as by doing this they would have more time 
to monitor or review the financial reporting process. Furthermore, the roles and definition 
of “independence” of audit committees should be strengthened and revised. 

iii



TABLE OF CONTENTS 

[AUTHOR’S DECLARATION 

ABSTRACT 

ACKNOWLEDGEMENTS 

TABLE OF CONTENTS 

LIST OF TABLES 

LIST OF FIGURES 

CHAPTER ONE: OVERVIEW OF RESEARCH 

1.1 Introduction 

1.2 Rmearch Problems and Research Questions 

1.3 Research Objectives 

1.4 Theory Underpinning Study 

1.5 Research Motivation and Contribution 

1.6 Significance of the Study 

1.7 Scope and Limitation of the Study 

1.8 Chapter Summary 

Page 

xiv 

xviii 

CHAPTER TWO: ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM: LITERATURE REVIEW 

2. 1 Introduction 

2.2 The Concept of Accounting Conservatism 

2.2.1 Conditional Conservatism 

2.2.2 Unconditional Conservatism 

2.3 The Issues of Accounting Conservatism in Financial Reporting 

2.4 The Motivation for Conservative Accounting 

2.4,] Contracting 

21 

22 

22 

26 

27 

31

32



2.5 

2.6 

2.7 

2.442 Litigation and Regulation 

2.4.3 Taxation 

2.4.4 Other Factors that Influences Accounting Conservatism 

The Role of Accounting Conservatism in Corporate Governance 

The Measurement of Accounting Conservatism 

2.6.1 The Asymmetric Timeliness of Earnings Measures for 

Accounting Conservatism — Basu (1997) 

2.62 Accruals-based Measures for Accounting Conservatism — Ball 

and Shivakumar (2005) 

2.6.3 Accrual-based Measure For Accounting Conservatism 

(CONACC) — Givoly and Hayn (2000; 2002) 

2.6.4 CSCORE Measure of Conservatism (Khan and Watts, 2009) 

2.6.5 Other Firm-Year Measure of Conservatism 

2.6.6 Book-to—Market Measures of Accounting Conservatism — 

Beaver and Ryan’s (2000) 

2.6.7 Conservatism Index — Penman and Zhang (2002) 

Chapter Summary 

CHAPTER THREE: AUDIT COMMITTEE: LITERATURE REVIEW 

3.1 

3.2 

3.3 

3.4 

3.5 

3.6 

3.7 

Introduction 

The General Overview of Malaysia Financial Reporting Environment 

The Development and Regulatory Framework of Corporate 

Governance in Malaysia 

Background to the Evolvement of Audit Committee 

Audit Committee Functions and Responsibilities 

The Roles of Audit Committees in Financial Reporting 

Audit Committees and Financial Reporting Quality 

3.7.1 Audit Committee Independence and Financial Reporting 

Quality 

3.7.2 Audit Committee Financial Accounting Expertise and Financial 

Reporting Quality 

vi 

35 

39 

39 

40 

42 

42 

45 

47 

48 

53 

53 

55 

57 

59 

60 

63 

65 

71 

75 

79 

79

81


	THE DOMINANCE OF DIRECTORS, AUDIT COMMITTEE EFFECTIVENESS AND ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM : MALAYSIAN EVIDENCE
	AUTHOR’S DECLARATION
	ABSTRACT
	ACKNOWLEDGEMENTS
	TABLE OF CONTENTS
	LIST OF TABLES
	LIST OF FIGURES
	CHAPTER ONE OVERVIEW OF RESEARCH
	1.1 INTRODUCTION
	1.2 RESEARCH PROBLEMS AND RESEARCH QUESTIONS
	1.3 RESEARCH OBJECTIVES
	1.4 THEORY UNDERPINNING STUDY
	1.5 RESEARCH MOTIVATION AND CONTRIBUTION
	1.6 SIGNIFICANCE OF STUDY
	1.7 SCOPE AND LIMITATIONS OF THE STUDY
	1.8 CHAPTER SUMMARY

	CHAPTER TWO ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM: LITERATURE REVIEW
	2.1 INTRODUCTION
	2.2 THE CONCEPT OF ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM
	2.2.1 Conditional Conservatism
	2.2.2 Uncunditional Conservatism

	2.3 THE ISSUES OF ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM IN FINANCIAL REPORTING
	2.4 THE MOTIVATION FOR CONSERVATIVE ACCOUNTING
	2.4.1 Contracting
	2.4.2 Litigntion and Regulation
	2.4.3 Taxation
	2.4.4 Other Factnrs that Influences Accounting Conservatism

	2.5 THE ROLE OF ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM IN CORPORATE GOVERNANCE
	2.6 THE MEASUREMENT OF ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM
	2.6.1 The Asymmetric Timeliness of Earnings Measures for Accounting Conservation - Basu (1997)
	2.6.2 Accruals-based Measures for Accounting Conservatism-Ball and Shivakumar (2005)
	2.6.3 Accrual-based Measure For Accounting Conservatism (CONACC) - Givolyand Hayn (2000; 2002)
	2.6.4 C_SCORE Measure of Conservatism (Khan and Watts, 2009)
	2.6.5 Other Firm-Year Measure of Conservatism
	2.6.6 Book-to-Market Measures of Accounting Conservatism-Beaver and Ryan’s(2000)
	2.6.7 Conservatism Index — Penman and Zhang (2002)

	2.7 CHAPTER SUMMARY

	CHAPTER THREE AUDIT COMMITTEE: LITERATURE REVIEW
	3.1 INTRODUCTION
	3.2 THE GENERAL OVERVIEW OF MALAYSIA FINANCIAL REPORTING ENVIRONMENT
	3.3 THE DEVELOPMENT AND REGULATORY FRAMEWORK OF CORPORATE GOVERNANCE IN MALAYSIA
	3.4 BACKGROUND ON THE EVOLVEMENT OF AUDIT COMMITTEE
	3.5 AUDIT COMMITTEE FUNCTIONS AND RESPONSIBILITIES
	3.6 THE ROLES OF AUDIT COMMITTEES IN FINANCIAL REFORTING
	3.7 AUDIT COMMITTEES AND FINANCIAL REPORTING QUALITY
	3.7.1 Audit Committee Independence and Financial Reporting Quality
	3.7.2 Audit Committee Financial Accounting Expertise and Financial Reporting Quality
	3.7.3 Audit Committee Diligence and Financial Reporting Quality
	3.7.4 Directors’ Dominance and Financial Reporting Quality
	3.7.4.1 Executive Directors’ Dominance
	3.7.4.2 Audit Committee Ownership
	3.7.4.3 Family Dominance


	3.8 AUDIT COMMITTEE AND FINANCIAL REPORTING IN MALAYSIA
	3.9 THE ASSOCIATION OF CORPORATE GOVERNANCE, AUDIT COMMITTEES AND ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM.
	3.10 CHAPTER SUMMARY

	CHAPTER FOUR CONCEPTUAL FRAMEWORK
	4.1 INTRODUCTION
	4.2 THE THEORETICAL RELATIONSHIPS OF AUDIT COMMITTEE AND ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM
	4.3 THE DEVELOPMENT OF THE HYPOTHESIS
	4.3.1 Audit Committee Independence
	4.3.2 Audit Committee Financial Accounting Expertise
	4.3.3 Audit Committee Diligence
	4.3.4 Executive Director’s Dominance
	4.3.4.1 Executive Director Ownership/Executive Director on Board
	4.3.4.2 Chief Executive Officer (CEO) Duality

	4.3.5 Family Dominance on the Board of Directors
	4.3.6 Audit Committee Ownership
	4.3.7 THE ASSOCIATION OF AUDIT COMMITTEE EFFECTIVENESS ANDDIRECTOR DOMINANCE AND THEIR LINKS WITH ACCOUNTINGCONSERVATISM
	4.3.7.1 The Association of Audit Cammittee Effectiveness and Executive Director Dominance And Their Links with Accounting Conservatism
	4.3.7.2 The Association of Audit Comittee Eflectiveness and Family Dominance and Their Links with Accounting Conservatism
	4.3.7.3 The Association of Audit Cammittee Eflecfiveness and Audit Committee Shareholding and Their Links with Accounting Conservatism


	4.4 CONTROL VARIABLES
	4.4.1 Firms Size
	4.4.2 Leverage
	4.4.3 External Auditurs
	4.4.4 Firms’ Growth
	4.4.5 Net Operating Cash Flows
	4.4.6 Firms’ Age

	4.5 DIAGRAMMATIC SUMMARY
	4.6 CHAPTER SUMMARY

	CHAPTER FIVE RESEARCH METHODS
	5.1 INTRODUCTION
	5.2 THE MEASUREMENT OF ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM-C_SCORE (KHAN AND WATTS, 2009)
	5.3 THE MEASUREMENT OF INDEPENDENT VARIABLES
	5.3.1 Audit Committee Effectiveness
	5.3.2 Director’s Dnminance
	5.3.3 Control Variables

	5.4 THE MODEL USED TO DETERMINE THE ASSOCIATION OF AUDIT COMMITTEE EFFECTIVENESS, DIRECTOR DOMINANCE AND THE CONTROL VARIABLES ON ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM
	5.4.1 The Association of Audit Committee Effectiveness and Director’s Dominance on Accounting Conservatism (C_SCORE)
	5.4.2 The Association of Audit Committee Elfectiveness and Director’s Dominance on Accounting Conservatism (CONMTB)

	5.5 THE EFFECTS OF AUDIT COMMITTEE EFFECTIVENESS AND ITS ASSOCIATION WITH DIRECTOR DOMINANCE TO MONITOR ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM
	5.5.1 The Effects of Audit Committee Independence and its Association with Directors Dominance to Monitor Financial Reporting Conservatism
	5.5.2 The Effects of Audit Committee Financial Accounting Expertise and its Association with Directors Dominance to Monitor Financial Reporting Conservatism
	5.5.3 The Effects of Audit Committee Diligence and its Association with Directors Dominance to Monitor Accounting Conservatism
	5.5.4 The Model Used to Determine the Effects of Audit Committee Effectiveness and its Association with CEO Duality (DUALTY) to Monitor Financial Reporting Conservatism

	5.6 STATISTICAL INFERENCE PROCEDURE
	5.6.1 The Diagnostic Tests on Regression Models and Sample Data
	5.6.2 Normality Assumption
	5.6.3 Multicollinearity Issue
	5.6.4 Autocorrelation Issue
	5.6.5 Heteroskedasticity Issue

	5.7 SAMPLING AND COLLECTION OF DATA
	5.8 ADDITIONAL TESTS
	5.8.1 Year-by-year Analysis
	5.8.2 Additional Tests Using Alternative Measurement for Audit Committee Effectiveness and Director Dominance
	5.8.3 Additional Tests by Dropping the Control Variables
	5.8.4 Additional Analysis on the Effects of High-Technology Firms
	5.8.5 Additional Analysis on the Effects of Firms’ Risk
	5.8.6 Additional Test of Using Panel Data
	5.8.7 Additional Test by Using Generalised Least Square (GLS)

	5.9 CHAPTER SUMMARY

	CHAPTER SIX RESULTS AND ANALYSIS OF DATA
	6.1 INTRODUCTION
	6.2 DESCRIPTIVE ANALYSIS
	6.2.1 Descriptive Analysis for the Accounting Conservatism Measures
	6.2.2 Descriptive Analysis for the Independent Variables
	6.2.3 Descriptive Statistics for the Control Variables

	6.3 CORRELATIONS ANALYSIS
	6.4 THE EMPIRICAL EVIDENCE ON THE ASSOCIATION OF AUDIT COMMITTEE EFFECTIVENESS, DIRECTORS DOMINANCE AND THE DEGREE OF FIRMS ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM
	6.5 THE EFFECTS OF AUDIT COMMITTEE EFFECTIVENESS AND THEIR ASSOCIATION WITH DIRECTORS DOMINANCE TO MONITOR ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM
	6.5.1 The Effects of Audit Committee Independence and its Association with Directors Dominance to Monitor Accounting Conservatism
	6.5.2 The Effects of Audit Committe Members with a Certification and Their Association with Director: Dominance to Monitor Accounting Conservatism
	6.5.3 The Effects of Audit Committees Diligence and its Association with Directors Dominance to Monitor Firms Accounting Conservatism

	6.6 Additional Test by Using Alternative Accounting Conservatism Measures -Market-to-Book (CONMTB)
	6.6.1 The Association of Audit Committee Effectiveness and Director Dominance and Market-to-Book (CONMTB) Conservatism
	6.6.2 The Effects of Audit Committees Effectiveness and its Association with Directors Dominance to Monitor Market-to-Book (CONMTB) Conservatism
	6.6.2.1 The Effects of Audit Committee Independence and its Association with Directors Dominance to MonitorAccounting Cnnservatism (CONM TB)
	6.6.2.2 The Effects of Audit Committee Members with Professional Accounting Certification and Their Assnciation with Directors Dominance to Monitor Accounting Conservatism (CONMTB)
	6.6.2.3 The Efl‘ects of Audit Committee Members with Audit Committee Diligence andTheir Association with Directors Dominance to Monitor Accounting Causervatism (CONMTB)


	6.7 ADDITIONAL ANALYSES
	6.7.1 Year-by-Year Test
	6.7.2 Alternative Measurement for Audit Committee Effectiveness
	6.7.2.1 Alternative Measurememfar Audit Committee Independence
	6.7.2.2 Alternative Measurement for Directors with Professional Certification in the Audit Committee and Audit Committee Diligence

	6.7.3 Alternatives Measurement for Director Dominance
	6.7.3.1 Alternative Measurement for Executive Director Ownership
	6.7.3.2 Alternative Measurement far Audit Committee Ownership

	6.7.4 The Regression Estimation Results Without Controlled Variables
	6.7.5 Additional Analysis on the Effects of Technology Firms on Audit Committees ’Effectiveness and Accounting Conservatism
	6.7.6 Additional Analysis on the Effects of Firms’ Risk on Audit Committee Efiectiveness and Accounting Conservatism
	6.7.7 Fixed Effect Test
	6.7.8 Generalised Least Square (GLS) Estimation

	6.8 CHAPTER SUMMARY

	CHAPTER SEVEN DISCUSSION OF FINDINGS
	7.1 INTRODUCTION
	7.2 THE ASSOCIATION OF AUDIT COMMITTEE EFFECTIVENESS ON ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM
	7.2.1 The Associatinn of Audit Committee Independence and Accounting Conservatism
	7.2.2 The Association of Audit Committees Financial Accounting Expertise and Accounting Conservatism
	7.2.3 The Association of Audit Committees‘ Diligence and Accounting Conservatism

	7.3 THE DOMINANCE OF DIRECTORS AND ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM
	7.3.1 The Association of Executive Director Dominance and Accounting Conservatism
	7.3.1.1 Executive Director Ownership
	7.3.1.2 Chief Executive Officer (CEO) Duality

	7.3.2 The Association of Family Dominance and Accnunting Conservatism
	7.3.3 The Association of Audit Committee Shareholding and Accounting Conservatism

	7.4 THE EFFECTS OF AUDIT COMMITTEE EFFECTIVENESS AND THEIR ASSOCIATION WITH DIRECTOR DOMINANCE TO MONITOR ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM
	7.4.1 The Effects of Professional Accounting Financial Expertise and Its Association with Director Dominance and Accounting Conservatism
	7.4.2 The Effects of Audit Committee Diligence and Its Association with Director Dominance and Accounting Conservatism

	7.5 THE ASSOCIATION OF THE CONTROL VARIABLES AND ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM
	7.6 THE IMPACTS OF HIGH-TECH FIRMS ON AUDIT COMMITTEE EFFECTIVENESS AND ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM.
	7.7 THE IMPACTS OF FIRMS' RISK ON AUDIT COMMITTEE EFFECTIVENESS AND ACCOUNTING CONSERVATISM
	7.8 SIGNIFICANCE OF THE FINDINGS
	7.9 IMPLICATIONS OF THE FINDINGS
	7.10 CHAPTER SUMMARY

	CHAPTER EIGHT CONCLUSIONS AND RECOMMENDATIONS
	8.1 INTRODUCTION
	8.2 RESEARCH SUMMARY
	8.3 CONTRIBUTION OF THE STUDY
	8.3.1 Accounting Theory
	8.3.2 Methodology
	8.3.3 Policymakers
	8.3.4 Academic

	8.4 LIMITATIONS OF THE STUDY
	8.5 FUTURE RESEARCH

	REFERENCES
	APPENDIX

