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ABSTRACT 

Adaptive reuse is an important strategy for achieving sustainability, as it ensures a 
continuous building life cycle and prevents building destruction. Adaptive reuse has 
the greatest potential to significantly decrease the environmental load of the built 
environment within the next 20 to 30 years. However, owners and practitioners still 
lack of point of references to justify and evaluate their decision-making with regard to 
the adaptation practice. The decision to reuse a building entails a complex set of 
considerations, including issues of economic, social, environmental, legislative and 
architectural. This research, therefore, aims to explore the unique criteria of decision­
making among practitioners when considering to adaptive reuse an existing building 
asset. Thirty (30) unique criteria of decision-making were identified through detailed 
literature review. The quantitative method of a self-completion questionnaire survey 
were conducted among stakeholders, including architects, valuers, planners, 
government department, developers and the building owners gather their opinion and 
view on criteria that influence the decision-making. The analysis of the survey 
revealed seven (7) key criteria that are influencing the decision-making to adaptive 
reuse the existing building: (1) building value; (2) building suitability; (3) structural 
condition; (4) official plan and zoning; (5) building code; (6) client requirement and 
(7) heritage designated. In this regard, while 'building value' criteria were the 
primary determinants influencing the decision to reuse or demolish, the suitability and 
structural condition of the asset juxtaposed with regulations were also considered. 
Additionally, issues associated with the environmental, economic and social tenets of 
sustainability were identified as being important, but were given less priority when 
considering reuse. As current building stock is rapidly becoming obsolete, emphasis is 
increasingly placed on them during the adaptive reuse decision-making process to 
ensure sustainable outcomes. The developed criteria identify the critical areas that 
owners, developers and key project stakeholders need to consider when deciding to 
either reuse or demolish an existing building. It also can be used to evaluate the 
economic, physical and social implications of undertaking a heritage project. 
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CHAPTER ONE 

INTRODUCTION 

1.1 Background of Study 

Malaysia intents to be a developed country by 2020 through the development 

of low-carbon, sustainable, inclusive and efficient use of resources. Socioeconomic 

development will shift from costly, conventional development path to the green 

growth path that will ensure sustainable socioeconomic development carried out at a 

very early stage of planning and subsequent to implementation and evaluation (Unit 

Perancangan Ekonomi, Jabatan Perdana Menteri, Rancangan Malaysia Kesebelas, 

2015). Green growth leads to changes as it is not only a strategic thrust of its own, but 

also a development platform that includes the three pillars of sustainable development, 

namely economic, social and environmental, and enable the country to face future 

challenges better. According to eleventh Malaysia Plan, the successful implementation 

of green growth will boost economic growth, changing the thinking and behavior of 

people and influencing the Government policy, industrial production strategy and the 

individual consumption patterns. This will correct the perception of the green growth 

being costly for long term investment. 

Buildings are concentrated in urban areas, where it becomes the focus of 

efforts to reduce carbon emissions related to building. In particular, the existing 

buildings constitute a part of the entire building stock all over the world and it is not 

possible to preserve them all intact. As a developing country, Malaysia has a large 

stock of invaluable, existing buildings. However, according to Ahmad and Rahman 

(2010), most of these existing buildings are not conserved well and most of them are 

in poor conditions due to damages. According to the statistic of Jabatan Warisan 

Negara (2015), there are 368 national heritage sites, consisting of sites, building, 

monument and object. Recently, a myMetro newspaper article stated that in 2015, 

there were 112 national heritage sites recognised. Since the heritage department was 

established in 2006, as much as 496 locations had been appointed as national heritage 

sites. 
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