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ABSTRACT 

Abstract: The special project is created hased on the prohlem that has been observed 
since trainee started the industrial training from r1 Fehruwy 20/R until 30th June 
2018 in Health Information Management Sen1ices (HIMS) at KPJ Pahang Specialist 
Hospital. Trainee has bee,; placed at HIMS under supervision of Miss Tengku Rusidah 
Binti Tuan Long and she is HIMS Officer that is responsihle for the HIMS 
Department. After that, trainee has been assigned to ohse111e the_ work process in the 
department because HIMS is one C?f the important clinical support departments in the 
hospital because they need to maintain the patient records or they-called it as .'folder·. 
After a month, trainee has determined the prohlemsfaced l�v HIMS Staff.\· that affected 
others department such as missing folder. folder cannot he trace l�v staff H1hen other 
departments. request for the folder. After that .. medical report sta{I· alvvays late in 
calculating the statistics for the completed inedical report that they must suhmit to 
operation manager every month. So trai,iee has dtcided to develop one system named 
as Meditouch System that can-assist staff in tracking the.folder and track all medical 
report requested and able to generate the report.from the medical report. The current 
manual system are not effective because they 011�y Hirote it into the paper {I there any 
request.for the.folder.from clinic and same goes to the medical report. Throughout the 
industrial training, trainee is able to improve skills in communication e.<,pecially when 
need to face the patient, learn the new working environment and apply all the theories 
that has been learning during studies, The. industrtal · training session is going well 
until the end and the staff in KPJ Pahctng Specialist Hospital gave a ,•e,y good 
cooperation to the trainee during the industrial training. 

Keywords: Medical Records, Medical Records System, Health b?fnrmation 

Management Services, Medical Report, lawyer Case 
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