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ABSTRACT 

Klang Valley is the most populated region in Malaysia so the development of the 
urban mosques in the region has grown rapidly as to serve the Muslim communities 
and at the same time to reciprocate with the increase of the Muslim population in the 
region. Observations on the urban mosques in the city centres like Kuala Lumpur and 
its peripherals especially during the Friday congregations noted to be overflow every 
time. They are mostly multi-leveled structures due to the limited plot of the urbanism 
characteristics. To date there is no study on the spatial organizations and activities of 
urban mosques in Malaysia recorded on the The research problems are to investigate 
whether such urban mosques spatial organizations are designed according to the 
guidelines from the Al Quran and Sunnahs; equipped with ancillary spaces for 
services and activities; which needs proper management of the utilization of the 
spaces and the maintenance of the buildings. The design of the spaces at the mosques 
is bounded by the spatial organization which needs to be observed by the 
managements and the designers of the mosques. At the same time, the local 
communities' religious and social needs are to be addressed accordingly in order to 
build better Muslim communities. The aim of this study is to establish urban mosques 
design and development guidelines with three main theoretical frameworks identified 
from the literature which are set as the objectives to identify the problems related to 
the overspill of spaces by studies on the community and the management of the 
mosques; their activities and facilities provided; the spatial organizations provided as 
per guidelines from the Al Quran and Sunnahs ; and the type of spatial organizations 
developed. The on-site observation and participation approach with case studies and 
data content analysis were conducted on four urban mosques in the Klang Valley city 
centres with different groups of community. Singapore MBF mosques were used as 
the preferred models. Lickert Scale convenient user survey on 400 respondents was 
conducted as supplementary evidences. The findings revealed that the mosques were 
designed without proper guidelines from the Islamic Religious Councils or 
Departments, the Authorities of mosque developments in the country; neither the 
designers properly referred to the guidelines from the Al Quran and Sunnahs; the 
Local Building Authorities did not impose related Building By Laws pertaining to the 
public assembly building; and there were no local demography surveys executed 
before the mosques were planned and built. This research provides important factors 
related to the spatial organization of urban mosques for the Authorities to consider as 
guidelines. 
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