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ABSTRACT 

Kelantan is part of the state in Malaysia which has various peculiarities in terms of food 
and culture as well as an attraction to attract people, including tourists to experience the 
benefits of Kelantan cuisine. In addition, there are also a number of issues that interfere 
with their own tourism industry in Kelantan where the generation Y nowadays less to 
practice and take food traditional heritage of Kelantan. This needs to be taken seriously as 
a food culture in society nowadays change when they are matched with outside influences. 
Therefore, a study conducted in the state of Kelantan, involving 365 respondents from 
Generation Y, aged between 15-40 years to reach an understanding of the history and 
culture of food, tools and methods of preparation, generation Y acceptation of food 
heritage and knowledge. Using the data collected, this study shows that there is a 
correlation between the history and culture of local food is related to knowledge 
generation Y on the heritage of food (j8 = .121, p <0.001 ***). In addition, there is a 
difference between the apparatus and method of preparation in traditional Malay cuisine 
yesterday and today and it is related to knowledge generation Y to food heritage by reading 
the mark H2 (/3 = -.016, p <0.001 ***). Finally, there is a relationship between acceptance 
and knowledge of traditional food culture among generation Y with the food itself. H3 
recorded (jS = .006, p <0.001 ***) have readings higher than HI and H2. Therefore, 
Generation Y needs to play a role in maintaining and preserving traditional food Kelantan 
so that it is not forgotten. Accordingly, it is our responsibility as a community as well as 
the present generation to preserve and uphold our traditional heritage food again so that 
the future generations can enjoy them. 

IV 



ACKNOWLEDGEMENT 

The greatest thank is owned to Allah S.W.T. for giving me strength and health to complete 
my study. I would like to take this opportunity to thank many parties who have involves 
during my journey in this field. Without their help, I would not be able to complete my 
study as it requires a lot of patience and motivation. I would like to express my deepest 
gratitude to my supervisor Assoc. Prof. Dr. Artinah Zainal for her full support, expert 
guidance, understanding and encouragement throughout my study and research. Without 
her incredible patience and timely wisdom and counsel, my work would have been a 
frustrating and overwhelming pursuit. 

In addition, I would like to take this chance to thank my lecturer Madam Ismayaza Noh 
for always helping me with my research work and academic writing during my graduate 
years in the faculty. A special appreciation and deepest thanks to my beloved narents in 
memory of my very dear late father Azmi Hussain and my beloved mother 

who always be there when I need them. Not to forget special thanks to my sisters 
who always be there and be my friends when I need their moral support and humor during 
my difficult time. Many thanks for your endless prayer. 

Here I would like to take the opportunity to thank the Department of Higher Education 
Ministry of Education for giving me the opportunity to become a research assistant on the 
project Fundamental Research Grant Scheme (FRGS). Not to forget my colleagues for 
helping me in preparing this study and often a point of reference. Finally, I hope that 
through this research it can be beneficial to the relevant parties. 

v 



TABLE OF CONTENTS 

Page 

CONFIRMATION BY PANEL OF THE EXAMINERS ii 

AUTHOR'S DECLARATION iii 

ABSTRACT iv 

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT v 

TABLE OF CONTENTS vi 

LIST OF TABLES x 

LIST OF FIGURES xii 

CHAPTER ONE: INTRODUCTION 1 

1.1 Background of Study 1 

1.2 Statement of Research Problems 3 

1.3 Research Objectives 6 

1.4 Research Questions 6 

1.5 Framework Research 7 

1.6 Research Hypothesis 8 

1.7 Significance of the study 9 

1.7.1 Theoretical Implications 9 

1.7.2 Practical Implications 10 

1.8 Definition of Operation 

1.8.1 History 

1.8.2 Culture 

1.8.3 Heritage 

1.8.4 Generation Y 

1.8.5 Knowledge and Acceptance 

1.8.6 Cooking Equipment 12 

1.9 Summary 12 

VI 



CHAPTER TWO: LITERATURE REVIEW 

2.1 Introduction 13 

2.2 Food and Culture 13 

2.3 Introduction of Kelantan State 16 

2.4 Food in Kelantan State 17 

2.5 Tools and Method of Preparation 18 

2.6 Acceptance of Generation Y Towards Food Heritage 23 

2.7 Knowledge of Generation Y Towards Food Heritage 26 

2.8 Relationship Between Food And Cultural History Of Knowledge 

Generation Y In Food Heritage 29 

2.9 Tools and Method of Preparation of Knowledge Among Generation 

Y Towards Food Heritage 30 

2.10 Acceptance of Generation Y Towards The Knowledge of Food 

Heritage 

2:11 Conclusion 

CHAPTER THREE: METHODOLOGY 

3.1 Introduction 

3.2 Research Design 

3.3 Population and Sample Size 

3.4 Instrument 

3.5 Method of Data Collection 

3.5.1 Quantitative Methods 

3.6 Pilot Study 

3.7 Analysis of Data 

3.8 Underlying Assumptions for Hierarchical Regressions Analysis 

3.8.1 Sample Size 

3.8.2 Multicollinearity 

3.8.3 Normality, Linearity, Homoscedasticity and Independence 

of Residual 

3.8.4 Outliers 

3.9 Conclusion 

32 

33 

34 

35 

36 

37 

41 

42 

42 

44 

44 

44 

44 

45 

46 

47 

VII 


