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ABSTRACT 

Extensible Business Reporting Language (XBRL) has evolved for over more than a 
decade that it affects the financial reporting landscape worldwide. However, since its 
evolvement, XBRL has yet to be fully adopted around the world, particularly in Malaysia. 
This study aims at providing better understanding on XBRL adoption by identifying the 
current state of XBRL adoption and type of adopter among the regulators in Malaysia. 
Subsequently, this study identifies what factors and how these factors influence XBRL 
adoption process of the regulators. This study develops a framework by utilising two 
research frameworks developed by Rogers's (1983) adoption process and DiPietro, 
Wiarda and Fleischer's (1990) Technological, Organisational and Environmental (TOE) 
framework. A case study approach consisting of interview and content analysis was used. 
This study shows that the regulators are moving towards full XBRL adoption although 
slow. Out of the four regulators, two regulators are considered early adopters whilst the 
remaining two regulators are early majority. Within the technological context, relative 
advantage and trialability are the driving factors in the knowledge and persuasion phase. 
In the decision-making phase, compatibility of XBRL taxonomy and stability production 
of XBRL instance documents, and standardised XBRL submission are the driving factors 
whilst stability of XBRL taxonomy, standardised XBRL taxonomy, availability of tools 
and software are challenges in the XBRL adoption process. In the implementation and 
confirmation phase, complexity of XBRL taxonomy is considered a challenge in the 
XBRL adoption process. Within the organisational context, management support is the 
driving factor whilst lack of expertise, skills and knowledge on XBRL are considered a 
challenge in the knowledge and persuasion phase. In the decision-making phase, 
capability and data assurance are challenges whilst in the implementation and 
confirmation phase, resource capacity, cost of adoption and financial resources are the 
driving factors to XBRL adoption process. Finally, within the environmental context, in 
the knowledge and persuasion phase, the driving factor is success stories. In the decision­
making phase, the driving factors are motivation of regulatory pressure and incentive 
provision whilst lack of effective XBRL committee involvement, leadership of XBRL 
committee, work culture communication among XBRL committee members are 
challenges in the XBRL adoption process. In the implementation and confirmation stage, 
reliance on external support, lack of government support, limited trading partners, critical 
mass, professional bodies' pressure and stakeholders' involvement are considered 
challenges in the XBRL adoption process. The findings in this study serve as guidelines 
to other regulators that have plans to adopt XBRL. 
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CHAPTER ONE 

INTRODUCTION 

1.1 Background of the Study 

Business reporting is a process of communicating companies' economic 

performance to stakeholders for various decision making purposes. This involves 

providing essential information to meet various stakeholders' expectations (Ernst 

&Young, 2014). The manner business reporting is communicated to stakeholders is 

tasked by regulators, companies, government agencies and users of information, hence, 

it benefits those latter in various different ways. This is done by providing business 

reporting, which consists of financial and non-financial information that is accountable 

and transparent. Such a position is crucial as sufficient and credible information can 

improve the confidence level of investors and other stakeholders transacting with the 

companies. Ligteringen and Arbex (2010) noted that business reporting provides more 

information on historical financial performances to investors, rather than non-financial 

information in making investment decisions. In terms of reporting financial 

information, Seetharaman, Subramaniam and Shyong (2005) reported that financial 

reporting is vital for communicating companies' economic performances to their 

stakeholders. However, these companies' traditional financial reporting practices have 

several weaknesses when meeting stakeholders' information needs. 

The Institute of Chartered Accountants in England and Wales (ICAEW) (2010) 

has emphasised that the traditional financial reporting is not capable of addressing a 

broad range of stakeholders' needs. Wood (2010) suggested that the traditional financial 

reporting focuses on only two key stakeholders, namely investors and companies. As 

for investors, a company's financial information is used for making investment 

decisions; whilst for the company, the management can obtain a better understanding 

of the company's strengths and weaknesses. However, the traditional financial reporting 

has been criticised before as it lacks quality, as in understandability (Ernst &Young, 

2014), reliability (Bonson, Cortijo & Escobar, 2009) as well as comparability and 

relevance (Pollock & Papiernik, 2001). Consequently, calls have been made to enhance 

the quality of financial reporting in order to improve companies' responsibility to their 
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