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ABSTRACT 
 

As per the Industrial Revolution 4.0 (IR4.0) requirements, the educational system has transformed the 
learning process into technology-based learning to meet 21st-century learning needs. Recognizing the 
relevance of modern technology, such as QR codes, to the community, especially students, the idea for 
a Policy Smart Card (PSC 1.0) was formed. PSC 1.0 contains a QR code that directs users to a custom-
built website containing Malaysian government policies. While the objective of this PSC 1.0 is to ensure 
that receiving information is practicable, could save time, and spread awareness and knowledge among 
people, especially students nowadays. The commercialization target of PSC 1.0 is students, particularly 
policy students, as well as lecturers. It is also expected to be benefits such as resources for the public.  
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1. INTRODUCTION  
 
Industrial Relationship 4.0 was created a few years ago to assist every industry, including education, in 
discovering new technologies (Savitri et al., 2021). The impact of IR 4.0 has transformed the 
educational system in innovations of teaching and learning skill technology-based learning (Ismail et 
al., 2020). Due to the global pandemic Covid-19, recent modifications in learning activities following 
new standards have had a massive impact on students' and lecturers' ability to cope with the new 
learning culture. According to Pravat Kumar Jena (2020), every challenge is an opportunity for 
educational institutes to strengthen the knowledge technology and infrastructure to address education's 
challenges during Covid-19. Technology has become an essential part of education (Ahmadi, 2018) and 
has been implemented in various ways to improve the student learning experience and improve the 
accessibility of knowledge (Bower, 2017; Lai & Bower, 2019).  

Furthermore, the growth in technology such as Quick Response (QR) code is becoming more 
popular in marketing, communication, the industry as well as education field (Chee & Tan, 2021). The 
development of QR codes is a revolution from the traditional bar code with different total data storage 
allowed (Sato & Henry, 2021). A previous study found that quick accessibility of the QR code by scans 
through specific devices has brought the QR code as one of the unique technology-based learning for 
learning activities (Sharma, 2013; Chee & Tan, 2021). Furthermore, adopting QR codes for course-
related activities has resulted in good attitudes regarding technology adoption among students (Abdul 
Rabu et al., 2019). Also, Bahtiar and Surjono (2020) discovered that QR code features help modernize 
traditional textbooks, inspire students, and make teaching easier to provide. Thus, in line with the 
innovation of technology-based learning for the educational system, PSC 1.0 has been introduced.  
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2. MATERIALS AND METHODS 

The main materials needed for this product are the various type of government policies in Malaysia. 
Besides, all the information needed for this product will be obtained from Malaysian government 
websites. A total of 28 different types of policies was successfully gathered into a single custom-built 
Google Sites webpage. Next, the website was developed to enable people to scan the QR code and link 
to https://sites.google.com/view/malaysian-government-policy/laman-utama. Furthermore, 
QRCodeMonkey.com and Canva.com were used to design the QR code as well as PSC 1.0. 
Nevertheless, the utilization of a laptop and a smartphone to access and testing the custom-built website 
for PSC 1.0. Figure 1 shows several websites used in creating and designing the product.

Figure 1.  Websites used for Policy Smart Card 1.0

3. DISCUSSION 

3.1: Problem statement      

There are a few issues that brought us to introducing the PSC 1.0. First, the traditional education 
systems, such as using textbooks in class, may be rendered outdated for students and educators in this 
century due to the disability to update the most current information. Second is the difficulty accessing 
and downloading the new government policy since it is provided on different ministerial websites. For 
example, the problem might occur when there is a 'pop quiz' related to the new government policies 
among students. The students must have the practicality of getting that information. Third, the level of 
awareness among students as well as the public regarding government policy is relatively low 
nowadays. Thus, the problem statement above illustrates the idea of PSC 1.0 that connecting people to 
the systematic platform of Malaysian government policies. 

3.2: Objectives

The main idea of PSC 1.0 is based on the practicality of getting the source of information, especially 
all policies in Malaysia, in one single card. We want the user to experience the true meaning of 
knowledge is just within your fingertips. Users can easily access the policy according to their demand 
by just scanning the QR code on the card, and it will bring them to a website where all the government 
policies are gathered in one place. Thus, we believe that this PSC 1.0 will make the searching time for 
a specific policy faster. Furthermore, we also want to spread awareness and knowledge regarding the 
importance of policy in our daily life. It is such an advantage when people can understand how the 
policy works because they will know their rights on something if anything ever happens to them. 
Policies are crucial in shaping the daily routines and people's life at full quality. We are committed to 
achieving these objectives so that more people can understand the policies in the most convenient 
method.
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3.3: Applications 
 

 
Figure 2. Design for PSC 1.0 

 
The application of the product is quite simple. The user only needs to have their smartphone and the 
PSC 1.0 to fully utilize the benefits. 
 

 
Figure 3. Our custom-built website. 

 
Based on figure 2 above, this is the front side of the smart card which includes a QR code for 

the user to scan with their smartphone. Then the user will be directed to the website where they can find 
various policies available in Malaysia gathered just in one place.  
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Figure 4. Example of how to download the document.

The user can just hover their mouse on any thumbnail on a specific policy, then click on the 
pop-out icon to continue their reading in PDF format. The user can click on the download icon to save 
the desired document by downloading the PDF softcopy on their devices.

4. COMMERCIALISATION 

This PSC 1.0 is an effort that benefits various parties because it can be used by almost everyone. Among 
the intended parties that we targeted to be our clients are the university students, especially those who 
partake in the course that involves policy studies. We are aware that policy study is a tough course that 
has a variety of syllabi, and the students need to read a lot of policies also reference materials to fully 
grasp the knowledge.  Thus, we believe that the PSC 1.0 is a must-have product for the students who 
take the policy studies because it is an innovation that is very useful for them. Using this smart card 
will make it easier for the students to search and find the policy they need according to their demands 
effortlessly. The second intended client is the lecturers. The reason why we targeted the lecturers is we 
want to make it efficient for them in terms of gathering the information. When they use the PSC 1.0, 
they just need a simple step to get all of the policies that existed in Malaysia compared to the orthodox 
method which they need to carry the physical policy books everywhere they go. Furthermore, we are 
very committed to spreading the awareness of digitalization and the importance of policy studies among 
the public. The illiteracy about policy could be reduced, and more people will know about their rights 
as citizens and consumers by understanding the policies that existed in Malaysia. Last but not least, we 
are intended to promote the design of our card to collaborate with Touch 'n Go on future product 
innovation. We believe that it will increase the probability for the target consumer to carry our card 
with them everywhere and benefit from it in several ways. To wrap up this section, we hope that our 
PSC 1.0 could be a game-changer in achieving a decent quality standard, especially in the educational 
field of study, by promoting it to all kinds of people. 

5. CONCLUSION 

The conclusion that can be drawn from this Policy Smart Card 1.0 is that it is essential in spreading 
awareness and information among the general public, particularly students because the application is 
simple to use and does not take up a lot of space. As a result, more students will desire to use the Smart 
card policy. This is calculated in light of the difficulties that students and lecturers face. Furthermore, 
new technologies have had a far-reaching impact on society, as they are no longer just a means of 
disseminating knowledge. There must have more invention and innovation of moving toward 
technology in the digital era. This policy on smart cards is a new invention.
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