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ABSTRACT

Failure cases occur on residual soil are due to the infiltration of the surface runoff
that occurred during the heavy rainstorm. Generally, this factor have resulted many
incidents which is commonly occur in Malaysia mostly are soil erosion, slope failure, and
landslide. This phenomenon always happen in natural slope or engineering slope. Besides,
the poor of residual soil behavior always leads to the settlement due to the foundations of
heavy structure are constructed on compressible and weak of soil behavior. There are a
lots of methods to improve engineering properties of residual soil.The poor behavior of
soil can be improve by increase the compressive strength of residual soil added with
various percentage of crushed coconut shell for the soil stabilization. The study conducted
is to determine the basic properties of residual soil that are collected from the field site at
Teluk Bahang, Balik Pulau, Penang. Apart from that, the main objective of this study is
focuses on analyzing and compare the effectiveness of crushed coconut shell in
stabilizing the residual soil that are collected from the field site at Teluk Bahang Balik
Pulau, Penang. Coconut shells are commonly available and economical materials.
Coconut shell has been crushed into small pieces using aggregate impact apparatus and
sieve passing through size 4.25 mm retained on 1.18 mm. This study are to improve
compressive strength of residual soil added with various percentage of crushed coconut
shell 0 %, 3 %, 6%, 9 % and 12 % CCS. The tests were conducted for various percentage
of crushed coconut shell which is directly being tested by performing Unconfined
compression Test (UCT) to analyze the shear strength of the soil. From the results
inferred that crushed coconut shell are effective in improving the engineering properties
of residual soil.The most effective results for the optimum value of Unconfined
Compressive Strength (UCS) of the soil were obtained with addition of 9% crushed
coconut shell (CCS).


