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ABSTRACT
Safety procedure is an important thing to be measured while dealing with the 
mechanical and electrical maintenance works especially in high-rise building. To 
make sure the safety of the maintenance workers, the employers should play their 
roles to prevent and avoid their workers from injuries and accidents during the 
maintenance works. The safety procedure should be implemented before, during and 
after the maintenance works. The first objective of this research study is to study on 
the standards safety practice in mechanical and electrical maintenance works in high 
rise building. Second objective is to identify the best practice of safety maintenance 
procedure for mechanical and electrical works. Finally, this research will proposed a 
basic guideline of safety maintenance procedure for mechanical and electrical works. 
The stage of research methodology includes preliminary study, collection of data, 
analysis of data and report writing. In this study, the primary data is gathered from 
site observation, questionnaires and semi-structure interviews with the respondents. 
Meanwhile, the secondary data is gathered mainly from research paper, books, 
related articles and journals. The questionnaire is distributed to respondents in three 
(3) case studies which are Bangunan Darul Ehsan, Shah Alam, Bangunan Dewan 
Bandaraya Kuala Lumpur (DBKL), and Menara HeiTech Village UEP Subang Jaya. 
The semi-structure interview sessions were carried out face-to-face with the building 
maintenance person and also with the management person from Energy Commission. 
The study has revealed that the safety during the maintenance works in a moderate 
level to each case study.

Keywords: Safety, maintenance, procedure, mechanical and electrical, high-rise 
Buildings.


	SAFETY MAINTENANCE PROCEDURE FOR MECHANICAL AND ELECTRICAL WORKS IN HIGH-RISE BUILDINGS
	ACKNOWLEDGEMENTS
	TABLE OF CONTENTS
	LIST OF FIGURE
	LIST OF TABLE
	LIST OF APPENDICES
	ABSTRACT
	CHAPTER 1 INTRODUCTION
	1.1 BACKGROUND OF THE RESEARCH
	1.2 RESEARCH STATEMENT
	1.3 AIM
	1.4 OBJECTIVES
	1.5 RESEARCH METHODOLOGY
	1.6 SCOPE AND LIMITATION
	1.7 SUMMARY OF CHAPTERS

	CHAPTER 2 LITERATURE REVIEW
	2.1 INTRODUCTION
	2.1.1 Definitions of Maintenance
	2.1.2 Maintenance Procedures
	2.1.3 Maintenance Classification
	2.1.4 Safety of Mechanical and Electrical Works
	2.1.5 High Rise Building

	2.2 MECHANICAL AND ELECTRICAL SAFETY
	2.2.1 The Role and Development of Safety
	2.2.2 Electrical Accident Statistics
	2.2.3 Electrical Accident Causes
	2.2.4 Standard Practice in Mechanical and Electrical Maintenance Works
	2.2.5 FACTORY AND MACHINERY ACT (1967)
	2.2.6 ELECTRICITY REGULATIONS 1994
	2.2.7 Safety Maintenance Works Practice

	2.3 SUMMARY

	CHAPTER 3 RESEARCH METHODOLOGY
	3.1 INTRODUCTION
	3.2 RESEARCH METHODOLOGY
	3.2.1 Stage 1: Preliminary Study
	3.2.2 Stage 2 : Data Collection
	3.2.3 Stage 3 : Data Analysis

	3.3 SUMMARY

	CHAPTER 4 CASE STUDY
	4.1 INTRODUCTION
	4.2 CASE STUDY 1 : BANGUNAN DARUL EHSAN, SELANGOR
	4.2.1 Case study background
	4.2.2 Maintenance Management of Bangunan Darul Ehsan
	4.2.3 Safety Procedure Applied During Mechanical and Electrical Works

	4.3 CASE STUDY 2 : BANGUNAN DEW AN BANDARAYA KUALA LUMPUR (DBKL)
	4.3.1 Case Study Background
	4.3.2 Maintenance Management of Dewan Bandaraya Kuala Lumpur
	4.3.3 Safety Procedure Applied During Mechanical And Electrical Works

	4.4 CASE STUDY 3: MENARA HEITECH VILLAGE, UEP SUBANGJAYA
	4.4.1 Case Study Background
	4.4.2 Maintenance Management of Menara HeiTech Village
	4.4.3 Safety Procedure Applied During Mechanical and Electrical Works

	4.5 SUMMARY

	CHAPTER 5 FINDING AND ANALYSIS
	5.1 BACKGROUND OF THE RESEARCH
	5.2 OBSERVATION
	5.3 QUESTIONNAIRES
	5.3.1 Visitor as Respondents
	5.3.2 Workers as Respondents
	5.3.3 Maintenance Workers as Respondents

	5.4 SEMI-STRUCTURE INTERVIEW
	5.4.1 Respondents Background
	5.4.2 Safety Standard Practice

	5.5 SUMMARY

	CHAPTER 6 CONCLUSION AND RECOMMENDATION
	6.1 INTRODUCTION
	6.2 CONCLUSION AS PER RESEARCH OBJECTIVES
	6.2.1 Research Objective 1
	6.2.2 Research Objective 2
	6.2.3 Research Objective 3

	6.3 FUTURE RESEARCH

	REFERENCES
	APPENDIX

